DATE:
PLACE:

TIME:

OFFICIAL
September 10, 2012

LINCOLN SCHOOL COMMITTEE
LINCOLN, RHODE ISLAND
MINUTES

June 26, 2012

Lincoln Administration Building Conference Room
1624 Lonsdale Avenue

Lincoln, Rl 02865

6:30 PM — Open Session

School Committee Members Present: Elizabeth Robson, Chair; Mary Varr, Clerk; Tracey Cavanaugh, Kristine
Donabedian, John Lafleur, Mary Anne Roll
Absent: Julie Zito, Vice Chair

Others Present: Georgia Fortunato, Superintendent; Mark Gadbois, Mencucci, Lori Miller, Melinda Smith

Opening Ceremony

Chair to report out any votes taken in Executive Session: Receive motion by committee
member to seal Executive Session Minutes pursuant to applicable provisions of RIGL 42-46-(4)&(5)
The Chair reported there were no votes taken in Executive Session.

Right to be Heard — None.

I.  Superintendent’s Report

a.

b.

Approval of Administrators’ Contracts

Motion to table by Lafleur. Seconded by Varr. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.
Approval of Administrative Support Staff Contracts

Motion to approve b Lafleur. Seconded by Var. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.
Approval of Student Assistance Services Contract

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Varr. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-0.

. Approval of 2012-13 School Committee Meeting Dates

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

Il. Civic Use of Buildings

a.

RI Association of School Principals Summer Conference @ LMS 7/31/12 & 8/1/12
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Varr. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

Ill. Personnel Recommendations

a.

a.

Administrative Appointment

Charlotte Tavares To: Administrative Liaison — High School
137 Pinecrest Drive Effective: 2012-13 school year
Pawtucket, Rl 02861 Salary: $375/day (90 days)

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

Resignations

Thomas Reeve From: Science Dept. Chairperson — High School
8 Maria St. Effective: June 12, 2012

Lincoln, Rl 02865

It was noted the position should be filled at the next meeting.

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Donabedian and Varr. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.
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Kimberly Beck From: Payroll Technician — Business Office
10 Bramble Lane Effective: June 15, 2012

West Warwick, Rl 02893

Motion to approve Lafleur. Seconded by Donabedian. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-O0.

Teacher Appointments

Amanda MacDonald To: Family & Cons. Science — High School
14 Sebastian St. Effective: August 22, 2012
Somerset, MA 02726 Salary: B-10 $75,249.00
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Varr. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.
TBD To: .8 Speech/Language — District-Wide
Effective: August 22, 2012
Salary:

The position is being reposted.
Support Staff Appointments

Karen Martin To: 19 % hr/week PT TA — Middle School
2 Christina Way Effective: August 29, 2012 — end of school year
No. Smithfield, RI 02896 Salary: $10.25/hour

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

Lauren Picard To: 15 hr/week PT TA — Central

3 Meadowbrook Road Effective: August 29, 2012 — end of school year
Lincoln, R1 02865 Salary: $9.75/hour

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

Robin Brown To: 15 hr/week PT TA — Saylesville

1204 Lonsdale Ave. Effective: August 29, 2012 — end of school year
Lincoln, Rl 02865 Salary: $10.25/hour

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

Summer Program Teaching Appointments

Susan Rodrigues To: SNAP Teacher - Northern

9 Brunswick Ave. Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012
Lincoln, R1 02865 Salary: $44/hour

Janet Malenfant To: SNAP Teacher - Northern

6 Birchwood Drive Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012
Manville, Rl 02838 Salary: $44/hour

Cynthia Soares To: SNAP Teacher - Northern

51 Governor St. Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012
Cumberland, RI 02864 Salary: $44/hour

Margaret Rock To: SNAP Teacher - Northern

114 Riverside Drive Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012
Riverside, Rl 02915 Salary: $44/hour

Patricia McKay To: SNAP Teacher - Northern

52 Smith St. Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012

Lincoln, RI 02865 Salary: $44/hour
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f. Susan Pepper To: Title 1 Librarian - Northern
286 Huntinghouse Road Effective: August 6, 2012 — August 15, 2012
No. Scituate, RI 02857 Salary: $44/hour
g. Debra Reddy To: Title 1 Phys. Ed. Teacher - Northern
16 Stoney Drive Effective: August 6, 2012 — August 15, 2012
No. Smithfield, RI 02896 Salary: $44/hour
h. Paula Paluch To: Title 1 Grade 3 Teacher - Northern
51 Turnstone Lane Effective: August 6, 2012 — August 15, 2012
Seekonk, MA 02771 Salary: $44/hour
i. Peter Moreau To: Math NECAP Review Teacher — High School
5 Wake Robin Road, Unit 2203 Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012
Lincoln, RI 02865 Salary: $44/hour
j-  Theresa DeRiso To: Reading/Writing NECAP Review Teacher —
5 Colonial Ave. Middle School
Barrington, Rl 02806 Effective: July 23, 2012 — August 9, 2012
Salary: $44/hour
k. Michael Manzi Jr To: Math NECAP Review Teacher — Middle School
179 Calaman Road Effective: July 23, 2012 — August 9, 2012
Cranston, RI 02910 Salary: $44/hour
I.  Doug Wall To: Math NECAP Review Teacher — Middle School
30 Towle Ct. Effective: July 23, 2012 — August 9, 2012
Douglas, MA 01516 Salary: $44/hour
m. Nicole Tetreault To: Math NECAP Review Teacher — Middle School
414 Old River Road Effective: July 23, 2012 — August 9, 2012
Manville, Rl 02838 Salary: $44/hour
n. Wendy McPeak To: Math NECAP Review Teacher — Middle School
1060 Great Road Effective: July 23, 2012 — August 9, 2012
Lincoln, RI 02865 Salary: $44/hour
0. Laurie-Jean Ciosek To: Summer Academy Teacher — Lonsdale
366 High St. Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012
Cumberland, RI 02864 Salary: $44/hour
p. Lauren Bentley To: Summer Academy Teacher - Lonsdale
94 Mill St. #104 Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012
Woonsocket, RUI 02895 Salary: $44/hour
g. Jeffrey Drolet To: Summer Academy Teacher - Lonsdale
275 Railroad St. Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012
Manville, Rl 02838 Salary: $44/hour
r. Andrea Aiello To: Summer Academy Teacher - Lonsdale
1570 Douglas Ave. Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012
No. Providence, Rl 02904 Salary: $44/hour
s.  Amy Archambault To: Summer Academy Teacher - Lonsdale
6 Betty St. Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012

Lincoln, R1 02865 Salary: $44/hour
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Jennifer Ecklund

5 Smith St.

Lincoln, R1 02865

Motion to approve by Lafleur.

Kristen DeMelo
3 Roosevelt Drive
Barrington, Rl 02809

Motion to approve by Lafleur.

Jennifer London
20 Kirkbrae Drive
Lincoln, Rl 02865

Motion to approve by Lafleur.

Yvette Coulombe
82 Plainfield Pike
Foster, RI 02825

Motion to approve by Lafleur.

Krisann Paradis
36 Evergreen Ave.
Tiverton, R1 02878

Motion to approve by Lafleur.

Graham Souness
5 Teakwood Ct.
East Greenwich, Rl 02818

Motion to approve by Lafleur.

Joseph Parenteau
22 RiverView Ave.
Smithfield, RI 02917

Motion to approve by Lafleur.

Vernon Howard
1730 Old Louisquisset Pike
Lincoln, Rl 02865

Motion to approve by Lafleur.

John LaFleur
78 Carriage Drive
Lincoln, Rl 02865

To: Summer Academy Teacher - Lonsdale
Effective: July 10, 2012 — August 2, 2012
Salary: $44/hour

Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

Co-Curricular Appointments

To: Yearbook Advisor — High School
Effective: 2012 - 2013 school year
Salary: Per contract

Seconded by Roll. All'in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

Team Leader Appointments

To: Middle School Technology/World Languages/
Art Team Co-Leader
Effective: 2012 - 2013 school year
Salary: Per contract
Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

To: Middle School Technology/World Languages/
Art Team Co-Leader

Effective: 2012 — 2013 school year
Salary: Per contract
Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.
To: Middle School Phys. Ed/Music Team Leader
Effective: 2012 — 2013 school year

Salary: Per contract
Seconded by Varr. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

Coaching Appointments

To: Girls Soccer Assistant Coach — High School
Effective: 2012 — 2013 Fall Sports Season

Salary: Per contract

Seconded by Roll and Cavanaugh. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.
To: Cross Country Coach — Middle School
Effective: 2012 — 2013 Fall Sports Season

Salary: Per contract

Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.
To: Boys Soccer Coach — Middle School
Effective: 2012 — 2013 Fall Sports Season
Salary: Per contract

Seconded by Donabedian. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.
To: Girls Soccer Coach — Middle School
Effective: 2012 — 2013 Fall Sports Season
Salary: N/A

It was noted there is no salary; John is a volunteer.
Motion to approve by Roll. Seconded by Varr. All in favor. Motion carried 5-0, with Lafleur recused.
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IV. Awarding of Bids
a. Fire Alarm Upgrades Administration Building

Nolin Electric $32,186
AFA Protective systems Inc 32,590
Energy Electric Co, Inc. 39,000
Calson Construction Corp 46,780
Alpha Electrical Contractors, Inc. 48,900

Lori Miller recommended awarding the contract to Nolin Electric in the amount of $32,186.
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-0.

b. Door Replacement High School Auditorium
Tower Construction Corp. $26,975
Maron Construction, Co. Inc. 31,500

Lori Miller recommended awarding the contract to Tower Construction Corp. in the amount of $26,975.
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

c. Skylight Replacement Saylesville Elementary

McKenna Roofing & Construction Inc. $14,800
Eagle Cornice Co., Inc. 19,500
Barboza & Sons Roofing Company 28,500
Maron Construction co., Inc. 46,300

Lori Miller recommended awarding the contract to McKenna Roofing & Construction in the amount
of $14,800. Angelo Mencucci reported there are 16 skylights.
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

d. Asbestos Abatement

General Environmental Services, Inc. $16,850
Acme Abatement Contractor, Inc. 22,000
AA Asbestos Abatement Company, Inc. 24,425
Coastal Asbestos Removal 22,900

Lori Miller recommended awarding the contract to General Environmental Services, Inc. in
the amount of $16,850.

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-0.

e. Carpet/Vinyl/Tile Installation
Domenic and Sons Floor Covering $19,000

Lori Miller recommended awarding the contract to Domenic and Sons Floor Covering in the amount
of $19,000.
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

f.  Paving Projects

LHS Central Northern Lonsdale Total
Hartford Paving $113,702 $130,766 $14,343 $8,624 $267,435
Cardi Corp 120,000 70,000 15,000 6,900 211,900
Beausoleil Bros. 117,000 90,500 6,600 4,000 218,100
JH Lynch & Son 182,555 157,377 16,310 9,677 365,919
T. Miozzi Inc. 165,083 94,739 12,348 7,563 279,733
Cassissi ll, Inc. No Bid 105,760 11,547 8,943 126,250
D’Ambra Construction No Bid 79,815 No Bid  No Bid 79,815

Lori Miller reported Hartford Paving didn’t provide references. She recommended awarding the contract
to Cardi Corporation for the High School and Central for a total of $190,000; and Northern and Lonsdale
to Beausoleil Bros. for $11,000.
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Motion to approve by Roll. Seconded by Cavanaugh. John Lafleur amended the motion to Northern
Lonsdale to $10,600. All in favor of the amended motion. Motion carried 6-0.

g. Masonry Repairs Administration Building

C & D Construction Company, Inc. $15,587

Cassisi ll, Inc. 16,300

Cornerstone Restoration, Inc. 16,900
Lori Miller recommended awarding the contract to C & D Construction Company, Inc. in the amount
of $15,587.

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-0.

h.  Window Replacement Administration Building
Windows Blinds Treatments
Martone Service Company $154,125 $75/window $110/window

Lori Miller explained this would be for 50 windows from the local budget. She explained there will be
a surplus in the budget in the medical lines and is not reimbursable by RIDE. There is an anticipated
savings in heating and cooling. Miller will charge a capital line and then count the offices and charge
a piece of it. She recommended Martone Service Company in the amount of $163,675.

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

i. Cargo Van
Interstate Ford Truck Sales, Inc. $21,442
Flood Ford of East Greenwich 21,559
Fall River Ford, Inc. 21,639

Lori Miller recommended awarding the contract to Interstate Ford Truck Sales in the amount of
$21,442. Again this will be from the local budget and not reimbursable by RIDE.
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

j. Cafeteria Equipment

Oven Hotplate Refrigerator Refrig/Freezer
Rice’s Food Equip. $4,138.00 $2,663.00 $2,895.00 $5,225.00
Kittredge Equipment 4,307.87 2,140.87  3,226.91 5,996.52

Lori Miller notes that Kittredge Equipment includes setup and installation. She recommended Kittredge
Equipment for a total of $15,272.17. This will be funded through the school lunch program.
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Roll. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0

k. Cafeteria Tables

Virco, Inc. $19,099.40
WB Mason 19,456.80
Robert H. Lord Company, Inc. 19,996.60

Lori Miller recommended awarding the contract to Virco, Inc. in the amount of $19,099.40 for 20
cafeteria tables. She noted Virco, Inc. has been the lowest bidder for the last three years.
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-0

[.  Math Manipulatives

Really Good Stuff $ 101.70
Didax Education Resources 131.40
ETA Hand 2 Mind 655.83
School Specialty 4,696.67
Lakeshore Learning Materials 9,468.03

Lori Miller recommended awarding the contracts to all the above vendors for a total of $15,053.63.
Motion to approve by Cavanaugh. Seconded by Lafleur. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0
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m. Athletic Uniforms

Girls Soccer  Girls Volleyball Total
Grogan Marciano Sporting Goods $6,288 $2,980.50 $9,268.50

Lori Miller explained girls soccer consisted of jerseys and shorts for home and away and for volleyball it is

just the jersey and singlets they wear. Tracey Cavanaugh requested a list of how the uniforms are
rotated.

Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Roll. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-0

n. Technology Professional Development

2012-13 2013-14 Total
Learning.com $ 57,500 $45,500 $103,000
Discovery Education 114,000 93,000 207,000

Lori Miller recommended awarding the contract to Learning.com in the amount of $103,000.
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-0

V. Salary Warrants

June 14, 2012 $1,136,335.95
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-0.

VI. Expense Warrants
June 26, 2012 2011-2011 FY $671,703.86
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-0.

June 26, 2012 2011-2012 FY (A) $207,269.74
Motion to approve by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. Allin favor. Motion carried 6-0.

VII. Adjourn
Motion to adjourn at 7:12 PM by Lafleur. Seconded by Cavanaugh. All in favor. Motion carried 6-0.

MARY VARR, CLERK DATE



