
        OFFICIAL 
September 12, 2011 

 
 

LINCOLN SCHOOL COMMITTEE 
LINCOLN, RHODE ISLAND 

MINUTES 
 

DATE:  June 13, 2011 
PLACE:  Lincoln Middle School 
  152 Jenckes Hill Road 
  Lincoln, RI  02865 
TIME:  7:17 PM – Open Session 

 
 

 
School Committee Members Present:  Elizabeth Robson, Chair; Mary Varr, Clerk; Tracey Cavanaugh,  
John Lafleur, Mary Anne Roll  
Absent:  Julie Zito, Vice Chair; Kristine Donabedian 
  
Others Present:  Georgia Fortunato, Superintendent; Eric Banville, Mark Gadbois, Margaret Knowlton, Monique  
Latessa, Jeannine Magliocco, Kevin McNamara, Angelo Mencucci, Lori Miller, William Skitt, Melinda Smith,  
Maryann Struble, Mark Thompson; Attorney Benjamin Scungio 
 

 

Opening Ceremony 
Chair to report out any votes taken in Executive Session:  Receive motion by committee member  
to seal Executive Session Minutes pursuant to applicable provisions of RIGL 42-46-(4)&(5) 
The Chair reported there were no votes taken in Executive Session. 

 

Right to be Heard – None. 
 

I.       Approval of Minutes 
a. May 16, 2011 Executive Session 
b. May 16, 2011 Meeting 

Motion to approve both sets of minutes by Varr.  Seconded by Roll.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 

II. Correspondence – None. 
 

III. Superintendent’s Report       
a. Citations for Retirees 

Superintendent Fortunato recognized Donna Salhany for 37 years of service and Norman Malboeuf  
for 37 years of service.  Each were presented with a certificate and gift from Mary Anne Roll and  
Tracey Cavanaugh.  Robert Pearson was recognized for 12 years of service; James McElroy for  
15 years of service and Ronald LaPorte for 35 years of service.  It was noted they were unable to  
attend. 

b. Student Citations  
The following students were recognized and presented with certificates: 
     Asjed Hussain for the National Merit Scholarship; Middle School Girls’ Soccer Team Northern  

Division Champions Fall 2010 Season; Lincoln Middle School Boys and Girls Track and Field  
Team for placing Third in the Northern Divisional Championship Meet.  The names of the 2011 
Division 1 North Boy’s Varsity Baseball Champions were read into the record: 
     Maxwell Blais, Samuel Brito, Daniel Cameron, Tyler Duquette, Joseph Hamilton, Douglas  
     Harrison, Kyle Jackson, Steven Marcello, Stephen McManus, Matthew Mennucci, Ryan  
     O’Dell, Zachary Perry, Cody Phillips, Tyler Santaniello, Jeffrey Sheehan, Matthew Sorkin,  
     Joseph Yankee, Nicholas Zammarelli, Coach Ed Hunt, Assistant Coach Sean Cavanaugh. 
Members of the Girls’ Softball Division 1 North Champions were also presented with certificates.   

Alyssa McCoart was recognized as Gatorade State Softball Player of the Year.           
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c. Book Awards 
Principal McNamara presented the following with awards: 
     2011 Rensselaer Medal for Mathematics & Science – Dory Enright 
     Bryant University – Jillian DeSimone 
     Harvard Book Prize – Dory Enright 
     Holy Cross Book Prize – Kyle Zheng 
     University of Rhode Island – Catherine Chatowsky 
     Wellesley College Book Award – Keiko Oki 
     Yale Secondary School Book Award – Jessica Carrignan 
     St. Michael’s College Book Award – Aisha Shah, Jacob Benoit 
 
Mr. McNamara and Mr. Brooder presented the 2011 Claiborne Pell Award in American History  
to Kristen McKay. 
Mr. McNamara also recognized Jessica Carrignan, Dory Enright and Kyle Zheng for being invited  
to participate in the 2012 National Merit Program. 

d. Lincoln High School Student Update 
Principal McNamara introduced Brianna Locurto, Senior Class President.  Brianna reported  
they held a car wash fund raiser and they run the concession stand at football games.  They are  
looking forward to their senior prom at the Pleasant Valley Country Club in Sutton. Spirit Week  
is dedicated to the senior class each year.  They will also be organizing a senior supper. 

                    e.   End of Year Superintendent’s Presentation – Central Office Showcase 
Superintendent Fortunato read the Mission Statement and spoke of her vision to become a nationally 
recognized, world class district in the next five years and to be a leading district in Rhode Island in  
the next three years.  She would like to create a learning community comprised of parents,  
community and business stake holders; have data driven decision making and to have the right  
person in the right job.  They will continue to work together with the staff, offering support with the  
Dana Center, Response to Intervention,  Study Island and provide professional development opportun- 
ities, create and monitor the Confucius Team and the Race to the Top.  They continue to work with 
curriculum and to improve student achievement, as well as develop the five year plan for Technology.  
Superintendent Fortunato noted the success of Rachel’s Challenge to promote kindness and stop 
bullying.  She intends to continue the effective allocation of community resources, such as the North- 
west Consortium and PTO Liaisons.  Superintendent Fortunato commented on the success of full  
day K and the neighborhood school model. Utilizing technology through newsletters and websites will 
make it easy to know what is going on in the schools.  She stated they lead by example, recognizing  
the school community and the collaborative efforts with the 3300 students.  The Superintendent  
reiterated the importance of working together. 
  
Melinda Smith talked about the K-12 math, science, K-5 social studies implementation and the Race  
to the Top scope of work.  She noted the importance of the grants, including the academies at  
the high school in journalism and broadcast, design and engineering, international business and law 
started with the Perkins grant. This coming year they will add sports marketing and human services.  
Mark Gadbois talked about advances in technical communication with the enhanced website and  
Global Connect, the facilities with labs, laptop carts and smart boards.   He noted the importance of  
the Northwest Consortium and the current server utilization.  Maryann Struble talked about student 
services, noting the local special ed advisory group and the increase in parent participation.  They 
expanded support for struggling students through the intervention initiative at the high school and 
middle school.  RTI has been successful and the number of students requiring special education  
services is going down.  Eric Banville highlighted the work of the Safety Committee.  Through the 
Workers’ Comp carrier and the Trust they were able to look at the secretarial positions ergo- 
nomically.  He thanked the principals for their investigation of injuries to prevent further injuries.  
Banville commented on the poster contest and the quarterly goals and awards through the Trust.   
Angelo Mencucci reported on last year’s capital improvement projects that totaled $508,040.  He  
noted the savings through the Northwest Consortium on custodial supplies.  Mencucci reported on  
the roof snow removal and how bid requests were sent electronically last year.   
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Lori Miller made an analogy of each department being a working part of the body and how one  
can’t work without the other.  She reported on her supporting role in bids, payroll and the Northwest 
Consortium.  Miller also reported on the successful UCOA implementation, the early retirement 
reimbursement program application through the federal government.  The Superintendent thanked  
the Central Office staff for their hard work. 

         f.    Rescissions 
       Superintendent Fortunato read the following names: 
         Pamela Miller, Rhonda Sexton, Karen Moore, Dianne Walker, Lori Allen, Michael  

 Bedrossian, Brian Fineberg .4, Nicole Hallam .4, Kerri Salhany, Melissa Goho, Amy  
 Shunney, Beth Halliwell, Lauren Bentley, Kara Haddad, Yvette Mongeon, Michelle  
 King .8, Alessandra Almon, Jessica Galla, Colleen Boisvert .5, Lauren Renzi. 

  The Superintendent noted the four with points of FTEs, i.e., not a full 1.0 FTE. 
Motion to approve by Varr.  Seconded by Roll and Lafleur.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 

g.   Energy Presentation  
Mr. Fusco reported there was a savings of $1,082,153 or 26% over a 50 month period.  He  
commented that In 2007 he anticipated saving $365,000 in the by the 10

th
 year. 

h.    School Lunch Updates 
The Superintendent introduced Andrew Viveiros reported on how the lunch program is teaching healthy 
choices  
and now includes whole grains and locally grown fruit and vegetables.  Everything that Rhode Island 
grows is applicable to the lunch program.  He noted the salad head event has not been changed with 
students wearing gloves and the food can be consumed.   

i.     Approval of USDA Lunch Price Increase 
Lori Miller reported this is a mandated five cent increase to meet the price of reimbursement versus  
what is charged.  It won’t change the reduced lunch price.  Elementary will be $2.05 and secondary 
$2.30. 
Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 

j.     Approval of Disposition of Obsolete or Outdated Textbooks 
Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Roll.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 

k.    Approval of Roof Damage/Replacement Expenditure 
 Angelo Menccuci reported there were three damaged areas, the High School gym-south, new  
cafeteria at the High School and Lonsdale Elementary.  A full assessment was done district wide  
and these three were in need of replacement.  Lonsdale was due to ice damage and the high school  
was done by foot traffic during snow removal.  They are out of warranty and will go for bid.  The 
Superintendent noted the amount is $269,000; $107,000 Lonsdale, $42,000 for the high school  
cafeteria and $120,000 for the high school gym.    
Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Roll.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 

l.     Approval of 2011-12 School Committee Meeting Dates 
 Motion to approve by Roll.  Seconded by Lafleur.  All in favor. Motion carried 5-0. 
m.  Approval of By Laws of the Lincoln, RI Local Advisory Committee on Special Education 

Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh and Roll.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
n.    Financial Report/Charter Schools Update 

 Lori Miller reported they spent $377,000 for Charter Schools, so there should be a plus variance.   
 It will be close.  There will be negative variances in purchased services and tuitions. 

 

IV. Civic Use of Buildings 
a.  Lincoln Sports Camps – Summer 2011 Various Dates @ LHS 
     Motion to approve by Roll.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 

V. Personnel Recommendations   
Retirements 

 
 a.   James McElroy    From:  Inventory Control 
  16 Cabot Street    Effective:  July 7, 2011 
  Lincoln, RI 02865 
  The Superintendent made the recommendation with regret. 
  Motion to approve by Cavanaugh.  Seconded by Lafleur.   All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
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Resignations 
 

a. Donna DeSantis   From:  ESY TA – High School    
7 Ringgold Street   Effective: May 20, 2011 
Providence, RI 02903  
Motion to approve by Roll.  Seconded by Lafleur.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 

Leave of Absence Requests 
 

a. Heather Charlemagne   From:  Grade 6 – Middle School   
12 Laurel Hill Drive   Effective: March 28, 2011 – June 14, 2011 
Smithfield, RI 02917      
Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Roll.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 

 
b. Amy Laven    From:  Math - High School   

100 President’s Way, Unit 1431  Effective: 2011 - 2012 school year 
Dedham, MA 02026      
Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 

Long-Term Substitute Appointments 
 

a Amanda Stanford   To:  LTS – Grade 6 – Middle School   
 311 Langdon St.   Effective: March 28, 2011 – June 14, 2011 

Providence, RI 02904   Salary:  B-1  $10,982.65 
Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 

 

Department Head Appointments 
 

a.          Maryann Mitchell   To:  Business/FCS Dept. – High School 
 15 Sunview St.    Effective: 2011-2012 school year 

Lincoln, RI 02865   Salary:  Per contract  
 

b.  D. Jayson Schofield   To:  English Department – High School   
31 Jackson Ave.   Effective: 2011-2012 school year 
Johnston, RI 02919   Salary:  Per contract 
  

c. David Enos    To:  Fine Arts Department – High School                    
18 Sprague Ave.   Effective: 2011-2012 school year 
Lincoln, RI 02865   Salary:  Per contract 
 

d. Carol Michaud    To:  Guidance Department – High School   
683 Greenville Road   Effective: 2011-2012 school year 
No. Smithfield, RI 02896  Salary:  Per contract 
 

e. Roy Boudreau    To:  Technology Education Dept. – High School  
11 Ducarl Drive     Effective: 2011-2012 school year 
Lincoln, RI 02865   Salary:  Per contract 
 

f. Melissa Smith    To:  Mathematics Department – High School   
10 Jacqueline Court   Effective: 2011-2012 school year 
Cranston, RI 02921   Salary:  Per contract 
 

g. James Frost    To:  Phys. Ed/Health Department – High School  
45 Grace St.    Effective: 2011-2012 school year 
Cranston, RI 02910   Salary:  Per contract 
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h. Thomas Reeve    To:  Science Department – High School   
8 Maria St.    Effective: 2011-2012 school year 
Lincoln, RI 02865   Salary:  Per contract 
 

i. Wayne Brooder    To:  Social Studies Department – High School 
142 Christopher Circle   Effective: 2011-2012 school year 
Westport, MA 02790   Salary:  Per contract 

    
j.     James Dempsey   To:  Special Education Department – High School  
       9 Conch Road    Effective: 2011-2012 school year 
       Narragansett, RI 02882   Salary:  Per contract 
  Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 

 
Curriculum Leader Appointments 

 

a. David Clegg    To:  Middle School Social Studies Curriculum Leader 
6 Bullock Ave.    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Barrington, RI 02806   Salary:  Per contract 
 

b. Stephen Martin    To:  Middle School Science Curriculum Leader 
35 Ash St.     Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Rehoboth, MA 02769   Salary:  Per contract 

 
c. Michael Manzi, Jr.    To:  Middle School Math Curriculum Leader   

179 Calaman Road    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Cranston, RI 02910    Salary:  Per contract 
 

d. Theresa DeRiso    To:  Middle School Eng. Lang. Arts Curriculum Leader 

5 Colonial Ave.    Effective: 2011-2012 school year  
Barrington, RI 02806   Salary:  Per contract 

       Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 

Summer Program Teaching Appointments 
 

a.    Karen Crowell    To:  SNAP Teacher - Saylesville 
19 Ash St.     Effective: July 11, 2011 – July 25, 2011 
Riverside, RI 02915    Salary:  $44/hour 
 

b.    Laurie-Jean Ciosek    To:  SNAP Teacher - Saylesville 
366 High St.    Effective: July 11, 2011 – July 25, 2011 
Cumberland, RI 02864   Salary:  $44/hour 
 

c.    Sarah Goldberg    To:  SNAP Teacher - Saylesville 
16 Lakeview Road    Effective: July 11, 2011 – July 25, 2011 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  $44/hour 
 

d.    Kelly Williamson    To:  SNAP Teacher - Saylesville 
154 Bear Hill Road    Effective: July 11, 2011 – July 25, 2011 
Cumberland, RI 02864   Salary:  $44/hour 
 

e.    Ann Whitelaw    To:  SNAP Teacher - Saylesville 
270 Woodward Ave.   Effective: July 11, 2011 – July 25, 2011 
Seekonk, MA 02771   Salary:  $44/hour     
 

f.    Dianne Mohler    To:  SNAP Teacher - Northern  
10 Tori Leigh Lane    Effective: July 5, 2011 – August 2, 2011 
Rehoboth, MA 02769   Salary:  $44/hour  



 

 
June 13, 2011 
Page 6 
 
 

g.   Susan Rodrigues    To:  SNAP Teacher - Northern  
9 Brunswick Ave.    Effective: July 5, 2011 – August 2, 2011 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  $44/hour  
 

h.    Janet Malenfant    To:  SNAP Teacher - Northern  
6 Birchwood Drive    Effective: July 5, 2011 – August 2, 2011 
Manville, RI 02838    Salary:  $44/hour 
 

i.     Cynthia Soares    To:  SNAP Teacher - Northern  
51 Governor St.    Effective: July 5, 2011 – August 2, 2011 
Cumberland, RI 02864   Salary:  $44/hour 
 

j.    Jessica Spizzirri    To:  SNAP Teacher - Northern  
22 Andrews Ave.    Effective: July 5, 2011 – August 2, 2011 
West Warwick, RI 02893   Salary:  $44/hour 
 

k.    Patricia McKay    To:  SNAP Teacher - Northern  
52 Smith St.    Effective: July 5, 2011 – August 2, 2011 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  $44/hour 
 

l.     Margaret Rock    To:  SNAP Teacher - Northern  
114 Riverside Drive    Effective: July 5, 2011 – August 2, 2011 
Riverside, RI 02915    Salary:  $44/hour 

   
n.    Andrew Hallam    To:  ELA NECAP Review Teacher – High School 

30 Ethan Street    Effective: July 5, 2011 – August 4, 2011 
Warwick, RI 02888    Salary:  $44/hour 

 
o.   Regina Ferreira    To:  Math NECAP Review Teacher – High School 

531 Snake Hill Road   Effective: July 5, 2011 – August4, 2011 
North Scituate, RI 02857   Salary:  $44/hour 
Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 

 

Co-Curricular Appointments 
        

a. Stephen Martin    To:  Audio Visual Advisor – Middle School 
35 Ash St.     Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Rehoboth, MA 02769   Salary:  Per contract 
      

b. Michael Miele    To:  Drama Advisor – Middle School 
156 Dellwood Road    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Cranston, RI 02920    Salary:  Per contract 
 

c. Hope Ausiello    To:  Drama Advisor – High School 
245 Old Wood Road South   Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
No. Attleboro, MA 02760   Salary:  Per contract     
             

d. Fred Hoppe Jr.    To:  Student Council Advisor – Middle School 
203 School St.    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Forestdale, RI 02824   Salary:  Per contract 
       

e. Krisann Paradis    To:  School Treasurer – Middle School 
36 Evergreen Ave.    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Tiverton, RI 02878    Salary:  Per contract 
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f. Kristen DeMelo    To:  Yearbook Advisor – High School 
3 Roosevelt Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Bristol, RI 02809    Salary:  Per contract 
  

g. Yvette Coulombe    To:  Yearbook Advisor – Middle School 
82 Plainfield Pike    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Foster, RI 02825    Salary:  Per contract   
Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 

     
Team Leader Appointments 

 

a. Elizabeth McGarry    To:  Middle School Team Leader – Team 1 
15 Lincoln Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
North Smithfield, RI 02896   Salary:  Per contract 
 

b. Kim McGowan    To:  Middle School Team Leader – Team 2 
49 Carriage Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

c. Nicole Tetreault    To:  .5 Middle School Team Leader – Team 3 
414 Old River Road    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Manville, RI 02838    Salary:  Per contract 
  

d. Nicole Tetreault    To:  .5 Middle School Team Leader – Team 4 
414 Old River Road    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Manville, RI 02838    Salary:  Per contract 
  

e. Erika Doherty    To:  Middle School Team Leader – Team 5 
31 Lynne Lane    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Mapleville, RI 02839   Salary:  Per contract 
 

f. Linda Graff     To:  Middle School Team Leader – Team 6 
78 Old Quarry Road    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
North Scituate, RI 02857   Salary:  Per contract 
 

g. Kristen Lowe    To:  Middle School Co Team Leader – Team 7 
5 Sutcliffe Avenue    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

h.    Brenda Sylvester    To:  Middle School Co Team Leader – Team 7 
PO Box 353     Effective: 2011 – 2010 school year 
Albion, RI 02802    Salary:  Per contract 
 

i.     Stephen Slattery     To:  Middle School Co Team Leader – Team 8 
7 Sheffield Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

j.     Denis Martel    To:  Middle School Co Team Leader – Team 8 
14 Hickory Lane    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

k.    Fred Hoppe     To:  Middle School Team Leader – Team 9 
203 School Street    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Forestdale, RI 02824   Salary:   Per contract 
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l.    Susan Johnson    To:  Middle School Technology/World Languages/  
17 DiFazio Drive      Art Team Leader  
Johnston, RI 02919    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
      Salary:  Per contract 
 

m.   Krisann Paradis    To:  Middle School Phys. Ed/Music Team Leader 
36 Evergreen Avenue   Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
Tiverton, RI 02878    Salary:  Per contract 

       Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 

Coaching Appointments 
 

a. Brian Fineberg    To:  Director of Athletics – High School 
10 Easter St.    Effective: 2011 – 2012 school year 
No. Providence, RI 02904   Salary:  Per contract  
 

b. David Waycott    To:  Football Head Coach – High School 
11 Memorial Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract  
       

c. Stephen Rodrigues    To:  Football Assistant Coach – High School 
1000 Lower River Road   Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract    
    

d. Susan Carlson    To:  Girls Cross Country Head Coach – High School 
2 Beverly Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

e. Victor Alves     To:  Boys Soccer Head Coach – High School 
333 River Road    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
       

f. John D’Aloisio    To:  Girls Soccer Head Coach – High School 
13 Foxwood Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract     
              

g. Jane Fish     To:  Girls Volleyball Assistant Coach – High School 
2 Boxwood Road    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

h. Robert Zimmer    To:  Girls Tennis Head Coach – High School 
143 Randall St.    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
North Easton, MA 02356   Salary:  Per contract 
 

i. Maria Ruzzano    To:  Girls Tennis Assistant Coach – High School 
50 Abbott Run Valley Road   Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Cumberland, RI 02864   Salary:  Per contract 
 

j. Rebecca Buontempo   To:  Cross Country Coach – Middle School 
2 Thomas Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

k. Ashley Mowry    To:  Field Hockey Coach – Middle School 
21 Morning Glory Road   Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Cumberland, RI 02864   Salary:  Per contract 
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l. Russell Metivier    To:  Field Hockey Assistant Coach – High School 

5 Alern Way    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

m. Vernon Howard    To:  Boys Soccer Coach – Middle School 
1730 Old Louisquisset Pike   Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

n. John LaFleur    To:  Girls Soccer Coach – Middle School 
78 Carriage Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Fall Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  N/A     

     
o. James Riel     To:  Hockey Head Coach – High School 

1159 Smithfield Ave.   Effective: 2011 – 2012 Winter Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
       

p. Joseph Pascone    To:  Boys Indoor Track Asst. Coach – High School 
20 Alma St.     Effective: 2011 – 2012 Winter Sports Season 
Providence, RI 02908   Salary:  Per contract 
 

q. Susan Carlson    To:  Girls Indoor Track Head Coach – High School 
2 Beverly Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Winter Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
       

r. Thomas DiIorio    To:  Swimming Head Coach – High School 
2 Peckham St.    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Winter Sports Season 
Attleboro, MA 02703   Salary:  Per contract 
 

s. Elizabeth Carlson    To:  Swimming Assistant Coach – High School 
2 Beverly Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Winter Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
  

t. Steven Carvalho    To:  Boys Basketball Coach – Middle School 
25 Franklin St.    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Winter Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

u. Jon Bruckner    To:  Girls Basketball Coach – Middle School 
PO Box 501     Effective: 2011 – 2012 Winter Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

v. Thomas Burlingame    To:  Wrestling Coach – Middle School 
12 Barbara’s Way    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Winter Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract      
      

w. Robert Morris    To:  Baseball Coach – Middle School 
54 Campbell Ave.    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Spring Sports Season 
No. Providence, RI 02904   Salary:  Per contract 
 

x. Rebecca Buontempo   To:  Track Coach – Middle School 
2 Thomas Drive    Effective: 2011 – 2012 Spring Sports Season 
Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
 

y.    Randy Licciardi    To:  Girls Softball – Middle School 
       1563 Lonsdale Avenue   Effective: 2011-2012 Spring Sports Season 
       Lincoln, RI 02865    Salary:  Per contract 
       Motion to approve by Cavanaugh.  Seconded by Varr.  Motion carried 4-0, with Lafleur abstaining. 
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Information Only 
 a.  Custodian Job Fair Results (attached) 
 
 VI. Awarding of Bids  
  a.  Athletic Uniforms 
        
   Grogan Marciano Sporting Goods $12,636.00 
 
       Miller recommended approving the Grogan Marciano Sporting Goods bid for $12,636.00 
       Motion to approve by Cavanaugh.  Seconded by Roll and Lafleur.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 
  b.  Cafeteria Equipment 
        This includes a gas conveyor oven, two cold pan serving counters and one utility station. 
 
   Sysco Boston    $28,552.22 
   Rice’s Food Equipment     29,709.00 
 
        Miller recommended the bid by Sysco Boston for $28,552.22 
        Motion to approve by Cavanaugh.  Seconded by Varr.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 
  c.  Interactive Whiteboards & Tables 
                          Whiteboards  Tables 
   CDW Govermment LLC   $3,968.37  No Bid 
   HB Communications Inc.    4,300.00  No Bid 
   Logical Choice Technologies Inc.   5,899.00  No Bid 
   Valley Communications Systems Inc.   6,215.55             $5,606.25 
   Atarza, Inc.      6,839.00  No Bid 
 

Miller recommended the low bidder for whiteboards, CDW Government LLC, for $3,968.37  
and the sole source bidder for tables, Valley Communications Systems, Inc. for $5,606.25.      

       Motion to approve by Varr.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 
   VII. Salary Warrants 
  May 5, 2011   $1,099,190.90 
 Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 
  May 19, 2011   $1,123,440.96 
 Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 
  May 26, 2011   $114,797.15 
 Motion to approve by Roll.  Seconded by Cavanaugh, Lafleur.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 
   VIII.    Expense Warrants 
  June 13, 2011  10-11 FY $1,120,731.13 
 Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 
    IX.     Old Business – None. 
 
     X. New Business 
   a.  Second Reading Parent Involvement Policy 
                    Motion to approve by Cavanaugh.  Seconded by Lafleur.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
   b.  Removal of School Parent Community Relations Policy (replaced by above) 

       Motion to approve by Lafleur.  Seconded by Cavanaugh.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
  The Chair noted they are trying to compact the policies to get onto the website.   
      

XI. School Committee Reports – None. 
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     XII. Community Comments 
Mary Ann McComiskey commented on the report on Central Office, noting their work is not noticed. 
She commented on the virtues of retires and wish them well, thanking them for a job well done. 
 

  XIII.  Adjourn 
 Motion to approve adjourning at 9:21 PM by Cavanaugh.  Seconded by Lafleur.  All in favor.  Motion carried 5-0. 
 

 
 

____________________________________  ____________________________  
MARY VARR, CLERK      DATE 
 
 

 
 

 


